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Attorney Elizabeth Etchells joins Dentons Davis Brown 
 
Elizabeth Etchells recently joined Dentons Davis Brown as an associate in the firm’s litigation division. Her 
varied experience brings a unique viewpoint to supporting clients. 
 
Before joining Dentons Davis Brown, Elizabeth served as an Iowa Assistant Attorney General, focusing on 
contracts, litigation, and projects related to Medicaid. Previously as clerk for Chief Judge John Jarvey of the 
US District Court for the Southern District of Iowa, Elizabeth prepared orders for complex civil and criminal 
litigation, coordinated pretrial conferences, and served as courtroom manager for over 16 jury and bench trials.   
 
Elizabeth earned her law degree from the University of Iowa College of Law in 2015 where she received the 
National Association of Women Lawyers Outstanding Law Student Award for her outstanding commitment to 
the advancement of women in society and the legal profession. Elizabeth received her bachelor’s from Bradley 
University in 2000 and a Master of Arts in literature from Durham University in 2003. 
 
About Dentons Davis Brown  
Dentons Davis Brown is a progressive, full-service Iowa law firm committed to helping a wide array of clients 
- from individuals to Fortune 500 companies. Founded in 1929, the firm is one of the largest law firms in Iowa, 
with over 75 lawyers across three offices, offering practical legal advice and comprehensive legal 
representation. The firm emphasizes diverse skills, ideas, and perspectives and this approach has led to 
extensive industry expertise and over 50 areas of law that continues to expand: agribusiness, banking and 
finance, biotechnology, capital markets and securities, corporate transactions and governance, emerging 
companies, entity choice, government relations, healthcare, immigration, insurance defense, labor and 
employment, litigation, mergers & acquisitions, patent and intellectual property, real estate, renewable energy, 
tax, and workers’ compensation. Learn more at www.dentons.com/ddb  
 
About Dentons  
Dentons is the world's largest law firm, connecting talent to the world's challenges and opportunities in more 
than 75 countries. Dentons' legal and business solutions benefit from deep roots in our communities and 
award-winning advancements in client service, including Nextlaw, Dentons’ innovation, and strategic advisory 
services. Dentons' polycentric and purpose-driven approach, commitment to inclusion and diversity, and 
world-class talent challenge the status quo to advance client and community interests in the New Dynamic. 
Learn more at www.dentons.com  
 
For more information, please contact Cara Seidl at cara.seidl@dentons.com. 
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